Finance and Business Operations Division =~ CONTRACTOR;

» Procurement and Contracts Services Section H D FOWLER CO INC CONTRACT
Department of Exccutive Services 1133)4;8}{5?.6301‘1{ ST
CONTRACT NO. REVISION PAGE
CNK-ES-0340 206-263-9400 Ph BELLEVUE, WA 98005-4439 United States 5671421 [ 0
KinaC ¢ 3rd Floor 206-296-7676 Fax Fax: (425) 6418885
INGLounty 401 5 Avenue TTY Relay: 771 )
SEATTLE, WA 93104 www.kingcounty.qov
SHIP TO; BILL TO: CREATION DATE BUYER
KC DES FBOD PCSS GOODS AND SERVICES KC DES FBOD ACCOUNTS PAYABLE 07-APR-2014 PAUL PRICE
401 5TH AVE, CNK-ES-0340 401 5TH AVE, CNK-ES-0320 ]
SEATTLE, WA 98104 SEATTLE, WA 98104 RETE OFYREVISTON] |JBUYER
CONTRACTOR NO |IPAYMENTTERMS "= = |[\FREIGHTITERMS [FOB= " == = [iSHIPVIAZ =" [ CONFIRMTO =~ = ==
1763 NET30DAYS Paid | DESTINATION UPS Telephone: (425) 746-8400
DESCRIPTION

CONTRACT PURCHASE AGREEMENT
**TOTAL CONTRACT VALUE CAN NOT EXCEED $25,000 WITH TAX***

FURNISH IRRIGATION & DRAINAGE SUPPLIES TO KING COUNTY PERSONNEL AS REQUESTED, IN ACCORDANCE WITH ITB #1008-14 AND RESPONDING OFFER OF HD FOWLER,
BOTH INCORPORATED BY REFERENCE AS IF FULLY SET FORTH HEREIN.

INDIVIDUAL STANDARD PURCHASE ORDERS WITH UNIQUE PURCHASE ORDER NUMBERS REFERENCING THIS CONTRACT PURCHASE AGREEMENT WILL BE ISSUED BY KING
COUNTY TO AUTHORIZE THE PURCHASE AND PAYMENT OF GOODS AND SERVICES.

ALL INVOICES MUST REFERENCE THE INDIVIDUAL STANDARD PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER TO AVOID DELAY IN PAYMENTS.

ESTIMATED ANNUAL CONTRACT VALUE $5,000.

Authorized Signature




" Department of Executive Services
m Finance and Business Operations Division
I nvitati O n to Bid . Procurement and Contract Services Section
King County 206-263-9400 TTY Relay: 711

ADVERTISED DATE: MARCH 18, 2014

Invitation to Bid (ITB) Title: Irrigation & Drainage Supplies
ITB Number: 1008-14-PAP

Due Date: April 1, 2014, 2014 - 2:00 p.m.
Buyer: Paul Price, paul.price@kingcounty.gov, 206-263-9309

Alternate Buyer: Michelle Poste, michelle. poste@kingcounty.gov, 206-263-9303

Furnish irrigation and drainage supplies as requested by King County personnel in accordance with
the attached instructions, requirements and specifications.

TOTAL BiD PRICE:  $ 87!7«57, 10

Sealed Bids are hereby solicited and will only be received by:
King County Procurement Services Section

No PRE-BID CONFERENCE Chinook Building, 3rd Floor
401 Fifth Avenue Seattle, WA 98104

Office Hours: 8:00 a.m. — 5:00 p.m. Monday - Friday

BIDDERS SHALL COMPLETE AND SIGN THE FORM BELOW.

We acknowledge that all Addenda have been examined as part of the Contract documents. The
submittal is signed by an authorized representative of the Bidder accepting all terms and conditions
contained in the bid and any addenda. We acknowledge that attaching our terms and conditions or
modifying the ITB terms and conditions may result in our bid being rejected.

Company Name

D Fowler Cbmr)ur?a.

Address : City/State /Postal Code
1349490 SE 2™ S* | Pellevue, wyp 98005
Signatu Z / /{/ Print name and title
Z 1A 7]'/“1/\ Wines 1L w;h,:J on_ Sqles
Email ; ledne | Phone == | Fax .
Yo hellyiler. o m | 425-746-84w| 425-649-49692

SCS/DBE Cettification Number

Upon request, this Invitation to Bid will be provided in alternative formats such as
Braille, large print, audiocassette or computer disk for individuals with disabilities.



SECTION 6 Bid Response

6.1 Rules of Price Evaluation
Bids meeting all requirements of this ITB will be evaluated on price. Bids stating price in effect
at the time of shipment will not be accepted. The County intends to award to the lowest,
responsible, responsive bidder. The County reserves the right to award to a secondary
contractor if desired.

6.2 Walk-in Orders, Will Call, & Delivery
The County estimates that 55% of orders will be will-call. Will call orders are called in ahead of
time and picked up in the store. It is estimated that 35% of orders will be walk-in orders. The
remaining 10% of orders will be delivered. Products are required as soon as possible and not
later than 7 days after placement of an order. Bid prices shall include delivery, FOB
destination, to various King County Parks locations throughout the County. The Contractor
shall notify the County when the order will be available for pick up.

6.3 Bidder’s Retail/Wholesale Locations
The Contractor is required to have at least two (2) locations located with-in King County. If
Contractor has more than two retail/wholesale locations, copy this page and submit for each
additional location. n

[

Location #1 - Physical Address: ,3LHD 5¢ %D\’“ S} E)Q”QV ve, W AT
Name of Contact Person: T: n N 2es
Email: ’I"t mm @ ‘LL(;[(DMVLCV. (o
Telephone No. (Local/Toll Free): ‘1S -74t-8400  Zo0-4£7-5290
Fax No. (Local/Toll Free): __ 425 - L4/ -2E£5 925-6Y1-YL92
State hours and days of operation:
Hours: 1 amto 5 p.m. Days: _ M on to_Fri
Location #2 - Physical Address: /4/7 Thorntin Ave SW Pacifc ) wh GeoNT
Name of Contact Person: Jol.a Nl eb £ngs
Email: }1 viiewd h ;,.U-m Lov. Lsna
Telephone No. (Local/Toll Free): _2S 3- 8,3 - £LoO
Fax No. (Local/Toll Free):
State hours and days of operation:
Hours: 1 a.m. to 5 p.m. Days: M A to Fri
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6.4

6.5

6.6

6.7

Remit Address (where payment will be mailed):
Rkko sE 3cobtH STREET
BELLEVWE , WaASHINGCTOWN
92058

UBINo.: 179-01€ -£79

Washington State Contractor’s License (if applicable): HD Fow DR bl K R
Important dates

ITB is advertised: ........cccovvvvevnn... March 18, 2014

Questions due: ............cccevvveene.. March 25, 2014 at 2:00 p.m.
ITBduedate:...........vvvveeieiere. April 1, 2014 at 2:00 p.m.
Prompt Pay Discount

Prompt payment discounts offered by Contractors shall be used to calculate the low bid
provided the discount offered allows a minimum of 20 days for payment. The number of days
is calculated from the date of acceptance of goods or services or from the date a complete
invoice is date stamped as received by King County, whichever event occurs last, and the
check/warrant date. The County will take advantage of any prompt payment discount terms bid
and will apply the discount offered to all p-card transactions. Discount periods shall be
extended if:

e The date printed on the invoice is more than three days earlier than the invoice receipt
date;

e The delay is caused awaiting a credit memo, invoice correction, adjustment or reissue;
e An invoice is received prior to receiving goods ordered.

Prompt pay discount offered % - Days, Net

Purchasing Card (P-Card) Acceptance

Contractors are requested to have the capability of accepting the King County's authorized
VISA Procurement Card (p-card) as a method of payment. Price change(s) or additicnal fee(s)
may not be assessed when accepting the p-card as a form of payment. The successful bidder
may receive payment from King County by a p-card in the same manner as other VISA
purchases.

VISA acceptance is preferred, but is not the exclusive method of payment.

Accept VISA cards: Yes ) No

ITB# 1008-14-PAP 25
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Additional purchasing (charge) cards accepted:

DAmerica Express

Discover

Bﬁaste rCard

[

_Other:

6.8 Attachment A — Pricing Sheet

A

ITB# 1008-1

Estimated quantities are the County’s anticipated requirements during a one (1) year
period and do not constitute a guarantee of work. Estimated quantities are used for bid
evaluation purposes only.

Pricing is all inclusive and includes: profit, iabor, fuel, surcharges, parking, shipping, and
all other direct and indirect overhead costs. No other charges will be allowed.

Bidders shall submit pricing using Attachment A - Pricing Sheet and shall be completed
in accordance with the requirements in this Subsection. A hard paper copy of
Attachment A - Pricing Sheet shall be submitted as part of the sealed bid submittal.

Bidders shall fill in the Unit Price and the Extended Total. In the event of a discrepancy
between the unit price and extended total, the unit price will prevail.

If an item has been discontinued and will not be replaced by the manufacturer, Bidders
shall state “discontinued” for the price.

If a part number has been updated or replaced with a different part number, the Bidder
shall draw a line through the old part number and list the new part number above the old
part number on the price sheet below.

Pricing shall not include tax.

This is firm fixed pricing contract. The Contractor shall request increases in accordance
with Section 4.3,

Contractors shall not alter the specification, pricing information section, and the terms and
conditions of this Invitation to Bid Number 1008-14-PAP. Any alteration may render a bid
non-responsive.

4-PAP 26

Irrigation & Drainage Supplies



ITB# 1008-14-PAP Attachment A - Pricing Sheet

Bid Evaluation for HD Fowler
{TB# 1008-14-PAP

Item | Est. Annual Catalog or | Discount
No. Quantity UOoM Part Number List Price Percent | Discount Unit Price |Extended Total
Toro Brand Sprinklers & Other Products

1 10 EA [644-02-43 $148.00| 55.00% $81.40 $66.60 $666.00
2 10 EA [642-02-42 $148.00| 55.00% $81.40 $66.60 $666.00
3 10 EA |640-02-42,192° Nozzle, Special Order $148.00| 55.00% $81.40 $66.60 $666.00
4 15 EA |640-02-42, 270° Nozzle, Special Order $148.00| 55.00% $81.40 $66.60 $999.00
5 80 EA  |640-0360 Gear Drive $85.50| 55.00% $47.03 $38.48 $3,078.00
6 40 EA [640-0180 Gear Drive $85.50| 55.00% $47.03 $38.48 $1,5639.00
7 10 EA [640-0090 Gear Drive $85.50f 55.00% $47.03 $38.48 $384.75
8 15 EA [640 238 Gear Drive $85.50| 55.00% $47.03 $38.48 $577.13
9 40 EA [640 192 Gear Drive $85.50, 55.00% $47.03 $38.48 $1,539.00
10 6 EA |640 127 Gear Drive $85.50| 55.00% $47.03 $38.48 $230.85
11 40 EA |640 Nozzle & Stator Assembly 41 $19.00 55.00% $10.45 $8.55 $342.00
12 10 EA (640 Nozzle & Stator Assembly 42 $19.00| 55.00% $10.45 $8.55 $85.50
13 15 EA (640 Nozzle & Stator Assembly 43 $19.00 55.00% $10.45 $8.55 $128.25
14 10 EA |640 Nozzle & Stator Asmbly 44 $19.00] 55.00% $10.45 $8.55 $85.50
15 30 EA |640 Nozzle & Stator Asmbly 40 $19.00f 55.00% $10.45 $8.55 $256.50
16 25 EA |640 Body, W/ Cap, Seal And Retainer $35.00f 55.00% $19.25 $15.75 $393.75
17 10 EA [S700 FC No bid

18 10 EA |[S700PC No bid

19 10 EA |T5P $15.88| 55.00% $8.73 $7.15 $71.46
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Bid Evaluation for HD Fowler
ITB# 1008-14-PAP

Item | Est. Annual Catalog or | Discount

No. Quantity Uuom Part Number List Price Percent | Discount Unit Price |Extended Total
20 65 EA |3000-00-00 Body only $21.00 55.00% $11.55 $9.45 $614.25
21 25 EA |300-01 $4.85 55.00% $2.67 $2.18 $54.56
22 20 EA [300-02 $4.85 55.00% $2.67 $2.18 $43.65
23 40 EA |[300-03 $4.85 55.00% $2.67 $2.18 $87.30
24 10 EA |570Z-4P-COM $6.55 55.00% $3.60 $2.95 $29.48
25 110 EA |570Z-6P-COM $13.30 55.00% $7.32 $5.99 $658.35
26 62 EA |570Z-12P-COM $18.75 55.00% $10.31 $8.44 $523.13
27 20 EA |640 Retainer 3-3755 $6.04 35.00% $2.11 $3.93 $78.52
28 85 EA |640 Seal/Nozzle Cont. 3-3756 $2.18 35.00% $0.76 $1.42 $120.45
29 145 EA |640 Cap 89-8999 $10.28 35.00% $3.60 $6.68 $968.89
30 60 EA |640 Drive Assembly 180 $85.50 55.00% $47.03 $38.48 $2,308.50
31 80 EA |640 Drive Assembly 90 $85.50 55.00% $47.03 $38.48 $3,078.00
32 80 EA |640 Drive Assembly 192 $85.50 55.00% $47.03 $38.48 $3,078.00
33 75 EA |640 Body 9-2099 $20.30 35.00% $7.11 $13.20 $989.63
34 35 EA |700 Rotor S700C CF w/Nozzle No Bid

35 30 EA [700 Rotor S700C PC w/Nozzle No Bid

36 110 EA |570 Nozzle 10F $2.30 55.00% $1.27 $1.04 $113.85
37 100 EA |570 Nozzle 10H $2.30 55.00% $1.27 $1.04 $103.50
38 100 EA |570 Nozzle 12F $2.30 55.00% $1.27 $1.04 $103.50
39 100 EA |570 Nozzle 12H $2.30 55.00% $1.27 $1.04 $103.50
40 100 EA |570 Nozzle 12Q $2.30 55.00% $1.27 $1.04 $103.50
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Bid Evaluation for HD Fowler
ITB# 1008-14-PAP

Item | Est. Annual Catalog or | Discount
No. Quantity UoM Part Number List Price Percent | Discount Unit Price |Extended Total
41 100 EA [570 Nozzle 15H $2.30| 55.00% $1.27 $1.04 $103.50
42 100 EA [570 Nozzle 5Q $2.30| 55.00% $1.27 $1.04 $103.50
43 20 EA |570 Nozzle 4" - EST $2.30| 55.00% $1.27 $1.04 $20.70
44 20 EA |570 Nozzle 4" - CST $2.30| 55.00% $1.27 $1.04 $20.70
45 100 EA |570 Nozzle 4" - SST $2.30| 55.00% $1.27 $1.04 $103.50
46 5 EA |220 Valve 2" $391.00] 55.00% $215.05 $175.95 $879.75
47 | $ 10,000.00 Other as-needed TORO Brand items not listed above 55%| $ 5,500.00 $ 4,500.00
Hunter Brand Products
48 15| EA |l40-04-SS $100.00 59.00% $59.00 $41.00 $615.00
49 15| EA |140-04-SS-HS Deleted
50 10| EA |l40-0455-HS Deleted
51 60| EA [l140-04-SS-HS Adjust/Full Circle $155.00| 59.00% $91.45 $63.55 $3,813.00
52 |'$ 1,500.00 Other as-needed HUNTER Brand items not listed above 59%| $ 885.00 $ 615.00
Buckner Brand Products
53 75 EA |HS100 Hose Swivel 1" $61.11 50.00% $30.56 $30.56 $2,291.63
54 75 EA |QB44KIO Coupler Key 1" $94.82( 50.00% $47.41 $47.41 $3,655.75
55 75 EA |QB44RCIO Coupler Key 1" $124.62| 50.00% $62.31 $62.31 $4,673.25
56 65 EA |MDLQB7RC15 1 1/2" $145.94| 50.00% $72.97 $72.97 $4,743.05
57 30 EA |QB7DK15 1 1/2" $132.44| 50.00% $66.22 $66.22 $1,986.60
58 75 EA |Al-123-24 Sprinkler w/ 3/8" Nozzle $324.29| 50.00% $162.15 $162.15 $12,160.88
59 60 EA [140-04-SS-HS Adjust/Full Circle Deleted
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Bid Evaluation for HD Fowler
ITB# 1008-14-PAP

Item | Est. Annual Catalog or | Discount

No. Quantity Uuom Part Number List Price Percent | Discount Unit Price |Extended Total
60 $ 3,000.00 Other as-needed BUCKNER Brand items not listed above 50%| $ 1,500.00 $ 1,500.00

Carson Brand Products

61 25 EA [1419 Valve Box Cover Only, Green $15.87 59.60% $9.46 $6.41 $160.29
62 100 EA [Valve Box Extension 12" x 18" x 6" $35.48 59.60% $21.15 $14.33 $1,433.39
63 75 EA |Green Poly Valve box 14"Wx19"Lx12"H $28.96| 59.60% $17.26 $11.70 $877.49
64 [ $ 1,500.00 Other as-needed CARSON Brand items not listed above 0%| $ - $ 1,500.00

item | Est. Annual

No. Quantity UOM Part Number Unit Price |Extended Total

PVC Pipe, Fittings and Misc. Related Items - No Brand Specified - Enter Unit Price & Extended Total Only

65 100 FT |PVC Pipe, CL 200, 1/2" $0.09 $9.00
66 100 FT |PVC Pipe, SCH 40, 1/2" $0.14 $14.00
67 100 FT |PVC Pipe, CL 200, 3/4" $0.11 $11.00
68 100 FT |[PVC Pipe SCH 40, 3/4" $0.20 $20.00
69 300 FT |PVC Pipe CL 200, 1" $0.15 $45.00
70 300 FT |PVC Pipe SCH 40, 1" $0.29 $87.00
71 200 FT |PVC Pipe, CL 200, 1 1/4" $0.24 $48.00
72 200 FT |PVC Pipe, SCH 40, 1 1/4" $0.40 $80.00
73 500 FT |PVC Pipe, SCH 40, 1 1/2" $0.47 $235.00
74 500 FT |PVC Pipe, CL 200, 2" $0.46 $230.00
i3 500 FT |PVC Pipe, SCH 40, 2" $0.64 $320.00
76 500 FT |PVC Pipe, CL 200, 2 1/2" $0.70 $350.00
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Bid Evaluation for HD Fowler
ITB# 1008-14-PAP

Item | Est. Annual Catalog or | Discount
No. Quantity UoMm Part Number List Price Percent | Discount Unit Price |Extended Total
77 500 FT |PVC Pipe, SCH 40, 2 1/2" $1.00 $500.00
78 2000 FT |PVC Pipe, CL 200, 3" $1.04 $2,080.00
79 500 FT [PVC Pipe, SCH 40, 3" $1.31 $655.00
80 500 EA |PVC Pipe, CL 200, 4" $1.74 $870.00
81 500 FT [PVC Pipe, SCH 40, 4" $1.92 $960.00
82 500 FT |PVC Pipe, Solid Drain, Smooth Wall, 4" $0.93 $465.00
83 500 FT |PVC Pipe, Solid Drain, Smooth Wall, 6" $2.02 $1,010.00
84 500 FT |PVC Pipe, Solid Drain, Smooth Wall 8" $3.62 $1,810.00
85 400 FT |PVC Pipe, PERF Drain, Smooth Wall 4" $0.87 $348.00
86 500 FT [PVC Pipe PERF Drain, Smooth Wall 6" $1.98 $990.00
87 200 FT [Flex Pipe, Tite Line, 4" ADS, 10' $0.56 $112.00
88 250 FT |Flex Pipe, Tite Line, 6" ADS, 10' $1.98 $495.00
89 150 FT |Flex Pipe, Tite Line, 8", ADS, 20' $0.56 $84.00
90 250 FT [Flex Pipe, PERF Line, 4" ADS 10' $0.55 $137.50
91 200 FT |Flex Pipe, PERF Line, 6" ADS 10' $1.55 $310.00
92 40 EA |Catch Basin 18"x18"x18" precast concrete $29.41 $1,176.40
93 40 EA [Catch Basin Cast Iron Frame & Grate 18"x18" $28.24 $1,129.60
94 35 EA |Nipple, Extension, PVC, SCH 40, 1/2" $0.26 $9.10
95 40 EA [Nipple, PVC, SCH 80, 1/2" x close $0.13 $5.20
96 40 EA [Nipple, PVC, SCH 80, 1/2" x 4" $0.21 $8.40
97 40 EA [Nipple, PVC, SCH 80, 1/2" x 6" $0.29 $11.60
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Bid Evaluation for HD Fowler
ITB# 1008-14-PAP

Item | Est. Annual Catalog or | Discount
No. Quantity UuomM Part Number List Price Percent | Discount Unit Price |Extended Total
98 40 EA [Nipple, PVC, SCH 80, 1/2" x 12" $0.44 $17.60
99 15 EA |ELL, PVC, SCH 40, 1/2" x 90 degree S/T $0.18 $2.70
100 15 EA |ELL, PVC, SCH 40, 1/2" x 90 degree T/T $0.34 $5.10
101 70 EA |ELL, Street, PVC, 1/2" x 90 degree Marlex $0.18 $12.60
102 25 EA |Coupling, PVC, SCH 40, 1/2" S/S $0.09 $2.25
103 25 EA |Coupling, PVC, SCH 40, 1/2" T/S $0.16 $4.00
104 30 EA |CAP/Thread PVC, SCH 40, 1/2" $0.27 $8.10
105 40 EA |TEE PVC, SCH 40, 1/2" S/SIT $0.23 $9.20
106 35 EA |Riser, Extension, PVC, 3/4" Spears $0.44 $15.40
107 15 EA |Nipple, PVC, SCH 80, 3/4" x Close $0.17 $2.55
108 25 EA [Nipple, PVC, SCH 80, 3/4" x 6" $0.38 $9.50
109 45 EA |[Nipple, PVC, SCH 80, 3/4" x 12" $0.88 $39.60
110 75 EA |ELL, PVC, SCH 40, 3/4" x 90 degree S/S $0.16 $12.00
111 o5 EA g(l)_l7__,SI1VRC, SCH 40, 3/4" x 90 degree S/T 407- | $0.20 $5.00
112 50 EA g(l)_l7_ PVC, SCH 40, 3/4" x 90 degree T/T, 408 $0.51 $25.50
113 45 EA |ELL Street, PVC 3/4" x 90 degree Marlex $0.36 $16.20
114 25 EA |Coupling, PVC, SCH 40, 3/4" S/S $0.13 $3.25
115 50 EA |Coupling, PVC, SCH 40, 3/4" T/T $0.33 $16.50
116 75 EA |CAP/Thread PVC, SCH 40, 3/4" $0.31 $23.25
117 60 EA |TEE PVC, SCH 40, 3/4" S/S/S $0.20 $12.00

6 of 9




Bid Evaluation for HD Fowler
ITB# 1008-14-PAP

Item | Est. Annual Catalog or | Discount

No. Quantity uom Part Number List Price Percent | Discount Unit Price |Extended Total
118 100 EA |Coupling, PVC, SCH 40, 3/4" Slip-Fix $1.45 $145.00
119 o5 EA gfsshmg, Reducer, PVC, SCH 40, 3/4" x 1/2" $0.15 $3.75
120 20 EA ?/lfrshlng, Reducer, PVC, SCH 40, 3/4" x 1/2" $0.42 $29.40
121 75 EA |Riser, Extension, PVC, SCH 40, 1" Spears $0.54 $40.50
122 110 EA |Nipple, PVC, SCH 80, 1" x Close $0.30 $33.00
123 40 EA |Nipple, PVC, SCH 80, 1" x 4" $0.50 $20.00
124 50 EA |Nipple, PVC, SCH 80, 1" x 12" $1.28 $64.00
125 25 EA |ELL PVC, SCH 40, 1" x 90 degree S/S $0.28 $7.00
126 45 EA |ELL PVC, SCH 40, 1" x 90 degree S/T $0.38 $17.10
127 60 EA |ELL, PVC, SCH 40, 1" x 90 degree T/T $1.08 $64.80
128 100 EA |ELL, Street, PVC, 1" x 90 degree Marlex $0.80 $80.00
129 30 EA |[Coupling, PVC, SCH 40, 1" S/S $0.22 $6.60
130 60 EA |Coupling, PVC, SCH 40, 1", T/T $0.44 $26.40
131 50 EA |Adapter, PVC, Male, SCH 40, 1" $0.26 $13.00
132 25 EA [Cap/Slip, PVC, SCH 40, 1" $0.23 $5.75
%)) 50 EA [Cap/Thread, PVC, SCH 40, 1" $0.47 $23.50
134 50 EA |Coupling, PVC, SCH 40, 1", Slip-Fix $1.64 $82.00
g5 70 EA |Coupling, PVC, SCH 40, 1", S/S $0.22 $15.40
136 25 EA |Coupling, PVC, SCH 40, 1" S/S $0.22 $5.50
137 70 EA [Bushing, Reducer PVC SCH 40 1"X3/4" S/S $0.27 $18.90
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Bid Evaluation for HD Fowler
ITB# 1008-14-PAP

Item | Est. Annual Catalog or | Discount

No. Quantity UOM Part Number List Price Percent | Discount Unit Price |Extended Total
138 25 EA |Bushing, Reducer PVC SCH 40 1"X3/4" S/T $0.38 $9.50
139 70 EA |Bushing, Reducer PVC SCH 40 1"X3/4" T/T $0.58 $40.60
140 45 EA |ELL PVC SCH 40 1 1/4" X 90 degree S/S $0.50 $22.50
141 50 EA |Coupling, PVC SCH 40 1 1/4" S/S $0.31 $15.50
142 100 EA |Coupling, PVC SCH 40 Slip-Fix 1 1/4" $3.04 $304.00
143 60 EA |Tee, PVC, SCH 40 1 1/4" S/S/S $0.59 $35.40
144 45 EA |Bushing Reducer PVC SCH40 1 1/4"X1" S/S $0.36 $16.20
145 $13) EA |ELL PVC SCH 40 1 1/2" X 90 degree S/S $0.54 $18.90
146 45 EA |Bushing Reducer PVC SCH40 1 1/2"X1" S/S $0.38 $17.10
147 40 EA |Coupling PVC SCH 40 1 1/2" S/S $0.33 $13.20
148 100 EA |Coupling PVC SCH 40 1 1/2" Slip-Fix $3.32 $332.00
149 45 EA 2;Jsshing Reducer PVC SCH40 1 1/2" X 1 1/4" $0.38 $17.10
150 25 EA [Coupling PVC SCH 40 2" Slip-Fix $5.24 $131.00
151 70 EA |Adapter PVC SCH 40 2" Male $0.54 $37.80
152 20 EA |Tee PVC SCH 40 2" S/S/S $1.04 $20.80
153 75 EA S;JSshmg Reducer PVC SCH 40 2" X 1 1/2" $0.63 $47.25
154 50 EA |Coupling PVC SCH40 2 1/2" Slip-Fix $11.06 $553.00
155 100 EA |ELL PVC SCH40 3' X 90 degree S/S $3.09 $309.00
156 100 EA |Coupling PVC SCH40 3" S/S $1.75 $175.00
157 80 EA |Bushing Reducer PVC SCH 40 3" X 2" S/S $1.50 $120.00
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Bid Evaluation for HD Fowler
ITB# 1008-14-PAP

Item | Est. Annual Catalog or | Discount

No. Quantity Uom Part Number List Price Percent | Discount Unit Price |Extended Total
158 75 EA |Bushing Reducer PVC SCH40 3" X 2" S/T $1.50 $112.50
159 30 EA [Coupling PVC SCH40 4" Slip-Fix $23.14 $694.20
160 100 EA |Test Cock, Brass w/ 1/4" Handle $10.48 $1,048.00
161 | $ 5,000.00 Other as-needed products not listed above 0%| $ - $ 5,000.00
162 Add total here and onto page one (1) of this ITB $95,176.44
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