Finance and Business Operations Division

F ] Procurement and Contracts Services Section
Department of Executive Services
CNK-ES-0340 206-263-9400 Ph
Ki 3m Floor 206-296-7676 Fax
mgcou“ty 401 5 Avenue TTY Relay: 771
SEATTLE, WA 93104 www.kingcounty.gov
SHIP TO:

KC DES FBOD PCSS GOODS AND SERVICES
401 STH AVE, CNK-ES-0340
SEATTLE, WA 98104

CONTRACTOR;
EXCEL GLOVES & SAFETY SUPPLIES
6808 26TH ST E STE 102

FIFE, WA 98424 United States
Fax: (253) 8961208

BILL TO:

KC DES FBOD ACCOUNTS PAYABLES
401 S5TH AVE, CNK-ES-0320
SEATTLE, WA 98104

CONTRACT NO.

5492504

CREATION DATE
18-SEP-2012

CONTRACT

REVISION

BUYER
MICHELLE POSTE

DATE OF REVISION

BUYER

CONTRACTORNO = P&YMENT TERMS FRE!GHT-TERMS —e= FOB = Sl SHI_PNIA. i ii- |: .!i:-|:: ii |.::|i.:||lii;:.: .CONHRM To == ;T'=_ --'='_: =y W ‘:. i :
4835 2%20DAYS/NET30DA | Paid DESTINATION UPS Telephone: (253) 896-1195
YS

REFERENCE AS
IF FULLY SET FORTH HEREIN.

DESCRIPTION

FURNISH RAINWEAR AND RELATED SUPPLIES, SCHEDULE 3 - TINGLEY AND SCHEDULE 5 - CARHARTT AS REQUESTED BY VARIOUS KING COUNTY DEPARTMENTS, DIVISIONS
AND AGENCIES IN ACCORDANCE WITH KING COUNTY ITB 1156-12-MYP AND THE RESPONDING BID OF EXCEL GLOVE & SAFETY SUPPLY COMPANY, BOTH INCORPORATED BY

S et

Authorized Signature




Invitation to Bid

ORIG I,

Department of Executive Services

Finance and Business Operations Dlvision
Procurement and Contract Services Section
206-263-9400 TTY Relay: 711

ksl

King County

ADVERTISED DATE: JUNE 7, 2012

Invitation to Bid (ITB) Title:
ITB Number:

Due Date:

Buyer:

Alternate Buyer:

Rainwear and Related Supplies

1166-12-MYP

June 21, 2012 - 2:00 p.m.

Michelle Poste, michelle.poste@kingcounty.gov, 206-263-9303

Paul Price, paul.price@kingcounty.gov, 206-263-9309

Furnish rainwear and related supplies as requested by various King County depariments, divisions
and agencies in accordance with the attached instructions, requirements and specifications.

No PRE-BiD CONFERENCE

Sealed Bids are hereby solicited and will only be received by:
King County Procurement Services Section

Chinook Building, 3rd Floor

401 Fifth Avenue

Seattle, WA 98104

Office Hours: 8:00 a.m. — 5:00 p.m.

Monday - Friday

BIDDERS SHALL COMPLETE AND SIGN THE FORM BELOW.

We acknowledge that all Addenda have been examined as part of the Contract documents. The
submittal is signed by an authorized representative of the Bidder accepting all terms and conditions
contained in the bid and any addenda. We acknowledge that attaching our terms and conditions or
modifying the ITB terms and conditions may result in our bid being rejected.

Company Name

Excel Gloves & Safety DBA Excel Supply Company

Address

2001 48t/l'yAve Ct East Suite A

i City/State /Postal Code
| Fife, WA 98424

.

! Print name and title
: Irene Reyes, CEQ/ President

Email il

%Phone

: Fax

N

~—glovelady@excelgioves.com | ;'r__25§§9§1 195 12538961208

SCS/DBE Certification Number
50

Upon request, this Invitation to Bid will be provided in alternative formats such as
Braille, large print, audiocassette or computer disk for individuals with disabilities.



SECTION 6 Bid Response

6.1

6.2

6.3

6.4

Rules of Price Evaluation

Bids meeting all requirements of this ITB will be evaluated on price. Bids stating price in effect
at the time of shipment will not be accepted. Bidders may bid on one or all schedules. Award
may be made, on a schedule basis, to multiple bidders.

Delivery

Delivery is required as soon as possible and not later than five (5) working days after
placement of an order. Bid prices shall include delivery, FOB destination.

A. Emergency delivery of Safety Stock is required within one (1) working day;
B. Set up time for the initial order containing County logo shall be seven (7) working days.

C. Minimum quantity or truck load delivery requirements will not be accepted under this
contract.

D. Please state discounts offered, if any, when an order is picked up at the Contractor’s
facility.
Pickup Discount Offered __ 2.00 %

E. Deliveries to Fleet Stores at 155 Monroe Ave NE, Renton, Washington shall be made

during the standard delivery hours, 8:00 A.M. to 3:00 P.M., Monday through Friday,
unless otherwise instructed.

Prompt Pay Discount

Prompt payment discounts offered by Contractors shall be used to calculate the low bid
provided the discount offered allows a minimum of 20 days for payment. The number of days
is calculated from the date of acceptance of goods or services or from the date a complete
invoice is date stamped as received by King County, whichever event occurs last, and the
check/warrant date. The County will take advantage of any prompt payment discount terms
bid. Discount periods shall be extended if:

o The date printed on the invoice is more than three days earlier than the invoice receipt
date;

» The delay is caused awaiting a credit memo, invoice correction, adjustment or reissue;
* An invoice is received prior to receiving goods ordered.
Prompt pay discount offered 2 %-__20 Dpays,Net__ 30

Service Expectation

The Contractor shall be currently supporting and maintaining an inventory of the items defined
in this bid. Additionally, the Contractor shall be operating out of a commercial facility, which is
open and accessible to County personnel, without prior notice for a minimum of eight (8)
consecutive hours between 7:00am and 6:00pm Monday through Friday (excluding holidays).
A site visit may be completed prior to contract award to determine if the successful Bidder is
capable of performing within the terms of the contract.

Bids shall include the Bidder's Hours of Operation and their commercial facility address.

DISTRIBUTED BY:
. ((cexcel

Rainwear and Related Supplies

]
0148 Rva, Ct. E, Sulte A
Fife, WA 98424
Tel: (253) 896.1195



Contractor’s Facility

Address: 2001 48TH Ave. Ct. East Suite A, Fife, WA 98424
Telephone No. (Toll Free): 1-888-900-4568
Name of contact person: IRENE REYES
State hours and days of operation:
Hours: 730 am.to 4 p.m. Days: MON ™ to FRI

6.5 Telephone Contact (Toll Free)
The Contractor shall provide a contact name and a direct telephone number. If the Contractor
is located out of King County’s local calling area, a toll free telephone number shall be
provided and maintained throughout the contract term. Under no circumstances shall County
staff be kept on hold longer than five (5) minutes. Electronic voice mail is not acceptable as an
answering service.
Name of contact person: IRENE REYES
Local/Toll Free telephone number: 1888-900-4568

ITB# 1156-12-MYP 27
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6.6 References

List the names and addresses of four (4) customers, for whom the bidder has performed or
provided similar goods and/or services, preferably in Washington State, for a period not less
than one (1) year. Include dates, contact persons and telephone numbers. Should any
reference submitted by a bidder be found unsatisfactory, King County, at its sole option, may
reject that bidder’s bid. King County shall be the sole judge in determining a
satisfactory/unsatisfactory reference response. Reference must be submitted with bid.

Company Name:
Company Address:
Company Phone:
Contact Person:
Dates:

Company Name:
Company Address:
Company Phone:
Contact Person:

Dates:

Company Name:
Company Address:
Company Phone:
Contact Person:

Dates:

Company Name:
Company Address:
Company Phone:
Contact Person:

Dates:

ITB# 1166-12-MYP
Rainwear and Related Supplies

KING COUNTY ( EXCEL HAS SEVERAL CONTRd4

206-263-9303

MICHELLE POSTE

1995 TO PRESENT

WA STATE DES

PO BOX 411017 OLYMPIA, WA 98504-1011

360-407-9403

CONNIE STACY

1995 TO PRESENT

CITY OF SEATTLE PUCHASING

PO BOX 94669 SEATTLE , WA 98124

206-233-7114

PAM TOKUNAGA

1995-PRESENT

GSA FSS FEDERAL CONTRACT

819 TAYLOR ST. RM 7a37 FORT WORTH, TX 7¢§

817-850-8220

TERESA HILL, SECTION CHIEF

2007 TO PRESENT

DISTRIBUTED BY:
((excel
01 25“5\;3. Ct.E, Euite A

Fife, WA 98424
Tel: (253) 896.1195



6.7 Pricing
In the event of a discrepancy, the unit price will prevail.
To ensure equivalence, the base (list) price shall be the current Manufacturer's Suggested List Price (MSLP), if applicable.
Using that as a basis, fill in the MSLP, the Discount Percentage (if any) you are offering and the Unit Price.
The discount percentage offered for the items listed shall be consistent for all related items purchased under this contract.
Example: If Bidder offers a 10% discount for an item listed in the bid document, the same discount shall be applied to ALL
items ordered, but not listed in the bid document.
Bidder may bid on any schedule and must bid on all items contained within a single schedule. |If an item has been
discontinued and will not be replaced by the manufacturer, Bidders shall state “discontinued” for the price. If an item has been
discontinued but has been replaced, Bidders may quote the equivalent replacement item
A. Schedule One —Helly Hansen, Hi-Visibility Orange Rainwear
High visibility, fluorescent orange PVC coated polyester rainwear with 360° visible reflective striping on jacket and
overall, and labeled as ANSI/ISEA 107-1999 Class 2: No Substitutions.
If your company utilizes a different part numbering scheme to identify the same manufacturer and style specified, note
that part number in the space provided below each item.
Estimated
Item . \ e Safety % e
No. Annu-al U/M Size Description Stock MSLP Disc Unit Price
Quantity
1 5 Each | Small H'elly Hansen Security Jacket 1
Style #70002, Orange NO BID
2 20 " Each | Medium Helly Hansen Security Jacket 5
Style #70002, Orange NO BID
3 40 Each | Large Helly Hansen Security Jacket 10
Style #70002, Orange NO BID
4 35 Each | Extra Large Helly Hansen Security Jacket 8
Style #70002, Orange NO BID

Rainwear and Related Supplies

su,gply company

' - __ DISTRIBUTED BY:
ITB# 1156-12-MYP 29 (((exce
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01 48" Ave. Ct. E, Suite A
Fife, WA 98424
Tel: {(253) 896.1195




Fife, WA 98424
Tel: (253) 896.1195

Estimated B
ltem | = nnual | UM Size Description Safety | ysip % | unit Price
No. ) . Stock Disc
Quantity
5 20 Each | XX Large Helly Hansen Security Jacket 5
Style #70002, Orange NO BID
6 5 Each | XXX Large | HeIIy Hansen Security Jacket 1
Style #70002, Orange NO BID
7 5 Each | XXXX 'Large Helly Hansen Security Jacket, 1
Style #70002, Orange NO BID
8 5 Each | Small Helly Hansen Security Bib Pant 1
Style #70402, Orange NO BID
9 20 Each | Medium Helly Hansen Security Bib Pant 4
Style #70402, Orange NO BID
10 40 Each | Large Helly Hansen Security Bib Pant 10
Style #70402, Orange NO BID
11 45 Each | Extra Large Helly Hansen Security Bib Pant 10
Style #70402, Orange NO BID
12 25 Each | XX Large Helly Hansen Security Bib Pant 5
Style #70402, Orange NO BID
13 3 Each | XXX Large Helly Hansen Security Bib Pant
Style #70402, Orange NO BID
14 5 Each | XXXX Large | Helly Hansen Security Bib Pant 1
' Style #70402, Orange NO BID
ITB# 1156-12-MYP 30 g DISTRIBUTED BY:
Rainwear and Related Supplies ((sepxce
148" Ava. o E Bata




B. Schedule Two — Tingley, Hi-Visibility Yellow-Green Rainwear

High visibility, fluorescent yellow-green, PVC coated polyester rainwear with 360° visible reflective striping on jacket and
overall, and labeled as ANSIISEA 107-1999 Class 2. No Substitutions.

If your company utilizes a different part numbering scheme to identify the same manufacturer and style specified, note

that part number in the space provided below each item.

Estimated
item 3 . Safety % -
No. Annu?l U/M Size Description Stock MSLP Disc Unit Price
Quantity
1 10 Each | Small Tingley Comfort-Brite Jacket 2
Style #J53122, Yellow-Green 60.86 40% 36.52
2 10 Each | Medium Tingley Comfort-Brite Jacket 2
Style #J53122, Yellow-Green 60.86 40% 36.52
3 20 Each | Large Tingley Comfort-Brite Jacket 5
Style #J53122, Yellow-Green 60.86 40% 36.52
4 15 Each | Extra Large Tingley Comfort-Brite Jacket 3
Style #J53122, Yellow-Green 60.86 40% | 36.52
5 5 Each | XX Large Tingley Comfori-Brite Jacket 1
Style #J53122, Yellow-Green 62.45 40% 37.47
6 3 Each | XXX Large Tingley Comfort-Brite Jacket
Style #J53122, Yellow-Green 62.45 40% 37.47
7 5 Each | Small Tingley Comfort-Brite Overall Pant 1
Style #053122, Yellow-Green 27.92 40% 16.75
8 5 Each | Medium Tingley Comfort-Brite Overall Pant 1
Style #053122, Yellow-Green 27.92 40% | 16.75

DISTRIBUTED BY:
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Estimated o
"o Annual | UM Size Description :;ectl‘(’ MSLP Di/; _ | unitPrice
" | Quantity
9 20 Each | Large Tingley Comfort-Brite Overall Pant 5
Style #053122, Yellow-Green 27.92 40% | 18.75
10 15 Each | Extra Large Tingley Comfort-Brite Overall Pant 3
Style #053122, Yellow-Green 27.92 40% | 16.75
11 10 Each | XX Large Tingley Comfort-Brite Overall Pant 2 \
Style #053122, Yellow-Green 23.85 40%  117.91
12 3 Each | XXX Large Tingley Comfort-Brite Overall Pant 9 T A
Style #053122, Yellow-Green s e :

ITB# 1156-12-MYP
Rainwear and Related Supplies

DISTRIBUTED BY:

e

supply company

Fife, WA 98424
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C. Schedule Three — Neese- Hi Visibility Yellow-Green Rainwear

A

High visibility, fluorescent yellow-green polyurethane coated nylon (urethane on outside) rainwear with 360’ visible
reflective striping on jacket and overall, and labeled ANSV/ISEA 107-1999 Class 2. No Substitutions.

If your company utilizes a different part numbering scheme to identify the same manufacturer and style specified, note
that part number in the space provided below each item.

Estimated '
Item i - Safety % it s
No. Annu.al Um Size Description Stock MSLP Disc Unit P_nce
Quantity
1 5 Each | Small Neese Telcom 7000 Jacket 2
Style # Yellow-Green 91.52 35% |59.48
702 A
2 5 Each | Medium Neese Telcom 7000 Jacket 2
Style # J, Yellow-Green 91.52 35% |59.49
3 30 Each | Large Neese Telcom 7000 Jacket 10
Style#~  J, Yellow-Green 91.52 35% | 59.49
0D R
4 25 Each | Extra Large Neese Telcom 7000 Jacket 10
Style # J, Yellow-Green 91.52 35% | 59.49
002 AJ
5 25 Each | XX Large Neese Telcom 7000 Jacket 10
Style # J, \;E}ow—(‘ireen 91.52 35% 59.49
T0p 2
6 3 Each | XXX Large Neese Telcom 7000 Jacket 1
Style# . Yellow-Green 100.67 35% [65.44
| 2 A
' 5 Each | Small Neese Telcom 7000 Overall 3
Style # _ Yellow-Green 51.563 35% 33.50
7004 BTFF
8 25 Each | Medium Neese Telcom 7000 Overall 5
Style# " , Yellow-Green 51.53 35% 33.50
Up R _AIF

ITB# 1156-12-MYP
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LA

M

Estimated
ltem | = nnual | UM Size Description Safety | - ysip % | Unit Price
No. . Stock Disc
Quantity
9 30 Each | Large Neese Telcom 7000 Overall 5
Style# ~~~ " -, Yellow-Green 51.53 35% | 33.50
10 20 Each | Extra Large | Neese Telcom 7000 Overall 5 |
Style #” ", Yellow-Green 51.53 35% | 33.50
92 5 |
11 20 Each | XX Large Neese Telcom 7000 Overall 5
Style # _Yellow-Green 51.53 35% | 33.50
A BTE
12 3 Each | XXX Large Neese Telcom 7000 Overall 1
Style # Yellow-Green 56.69 35% | 36.85
/1 £

ITB# 1156-12-MYP
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D. Schedule Four — Miscellaneous Rainwear, Related Requirements

ltem Estimated %
No. Annu-al Um Description MSLP Disc Unit Price
Quantity
1 5 Each | Rainwear Storage Bag
with drawstring closure, sized to accommodate any of the m (
rainwear brands listed in this document. State brand and safety 1}6( P0%
color offered. IO QL[ | 6 4

Brand and Safety Color Offered: /%7"/

2 100 Each | Imprint a King County Logo on Helly Hansen Rainwear Jacket. J 7 v 7/
Imprint shall be a contrasting color from the rainwear.
Placement in mutually agreed location on front of jacket. Size NA

of imprint shall be approximately 3"x4". Lead time for printing
shall not exceed 7 business days*

3 100 Each | Imprint a King County Logo on Tingley Rainwear Jacket.
Imprint shall be a contrasting color from the rainwear.
Placement in mutually agreed location on front of jacket. Size

. . ] - 4.50 35% 9
of imprint shall be approximately 3"x4". Lead time for printing ) 2
shall not exceed 7 business days*
4 100 Each | Imprint a King County Logo on Neese Telcom Rainwear Jacket.
Imprint shall be a contrasting color from the rainwear.
Placement in mutually agreed location on front of jacket. Size |4 g9 359% | 2.60

of imprint shall be approximately 3"x4". Lead time for printing
shall not exceed 7 business days*

) A (] ply company
Rainwear and Related Supplies o1 4:;'?1? Ave. CLE, Suite A

Fife, WA 98424
Tel: (253) 896.1195

DISTRIBUTED BY:
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C. Schedule Three — Neese- Hi Visibility Yellow-Green Rainwear (REVISED)

High visibility, fluorescent yellow-green polyurethane coated nylon (urethane on outside) rainwear with 360’ visible
reflective striping on jacket and overall, and labeled ANSI/ISEA 107-2004 Class3. No Substitutions.

If your company utilizes a different part numbering scheme to identify the same manufacturer and style specified, note
that part number in the space provided below each item.

T Frvm

Estimated 0
':fc’)“ Annual | UM Size Description z:;ect: MSLP Di/; . | unitPrice
" | Quantity
1 5 Each | Small Neese Telcom 7002 Jacket 2 .
Style # 7002AJ, Yellow-Green 91.52 35% |5949
2 5 Each | Medium Neese Telcom 7002 Jacket 2 . |
Style # 7002AJ, Yellow-Green 91.52 35% | 59.49
3 30 Each |Large Neese Telcom 7002 Jacket 10 _— 550/ ' 0.49
Style # 7002AJ, Yellow-Green : O
4 25 Each | Extra Large Neese Telcom 7002 Jacket 10 = a5
Style # 7002AJ, Yellow-Green Pl L Rt
5 25 Each | XX Large Neese Telcom 7002 Jacket ) 10
Style # 7002AJ, Yellow-Green 91.52 35% [59.49
6 3 Each | XXX Large Neese Telcom 7000 Jacket 1
Style # 7002AJ, Yellow-Green 100.67 35% |65.44
7 5 Each | Small Neese Telcom 7002 Overall 3
Style # 7002BTF, Yellow-Green 51.53 35% |33.50
8 25 Each | Medium Neese Telcom 7002 Overall 5
Style # 7002BTF, Yellow-Green 51.53 35% | 33.50

ITB# 1156-12-MYP
Rainwear and Related Supplies
Addendum No. 1
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Mow Foem

Estimated
Item i e Safety % o
No. Annu.al u/m Size Description Stock MSLP Disc Unit Price
Quantity
9 30 Each | Large Neese Telcom 7002 Overall 5 5153 a5 |33.50
Style # 7002BTF, Yellow-Green : ’ .
10 20 Each | Extra Large Neese Telcom 7002 Overall 5 o
Style # 7002BTF, Yellow-Green i sty [fS9:0
11 20 Each | XX Large Neese Telcom 7002 Overall 5 5153 35% 33.50
Style # 7002BTF, Yellow-Green
12 3 Each | XXX Large Neese Telcom 7002 Overall 1 56.69 5% 36.85
Style # 7002BTF, Yellow-Green

DISTRIBUTED BY
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Invitation to Bid L,g
Addendum #4 King County

ORIGINAL

Department of Executlve Services

Finance and Business Operations DIvision
Procurement and Contract Services Section
206-263-9400 TTY Relay: 711

ADDENDUM DATE: JUNE 20, 2012

Invitation to Bid (ITB) Title: Rainwear and Related Supplies

ITB Number: 1156-12-MYP

Revised Due Date; July 17, 2012 - 2:00 p.m.

Buyer: Michelle Poste, michelle.poste@kingcounty.gov, 206-263-9303

Alternate Buyer: Vicki Nakamichi, vicki.nakamichi@kingcounty.gov, 206-263-9299

This addendum is issued to revise the original Invitation to Bid No. 1156-12-MYP:

1. The bid opening date has changed from July 10, 2012 to July 17, 2012,

Upon request, this Invitation to Bid Addendum will be provided in alternative
formats such as Braille, large print, audiocassette or computer disk for individuals

with disabilities.



Invitation to Bid Lg
Addendum #5 King County

Department of Executive Services

Finance and Business Operations Division
Procurement and Contract Services Section
206-263-9400 TTY Relay: 711

ADDENDUM DATE: JUNE 16,2012

Invitation to Bid (ITB) Title: Rainwear and Related Supplies

ITB Number: 1156-12-MYP

Revised Due Date: July 24, 2012 - 2:00 p.m..

Buyer: Michelle Poste, miohelle.poste@ki"ngcounty.gov, 206-263-9303

Alternate Buyer: Vicki Nakamichi, vicki.nakamichi@kingcounty.gov, 206-263-9299

This addendum is issued to revise the original Invitation to Bid No. 1156-12-MYP:

1. The bid opening date has changed from July 17, 2012 to July 24, 2012.

2. Section 6.7 Pricing, E. Schedule 5 - Carhartt Foul Weather Gear, delete:
2. Safety vests and rain jackets shall be ANSI/ISEA 107-2010 Class 3 Level 2.




Department of Executive Services

I nVitatlo n to Bld m Finance and Buslness Operations Division

Procurement and Contract Services Section

Addendum #1 KingCounty 206-263-9400 TTY Relay: 711

ADDENDUM DATE: JUNE 13, 2012

Invitation to Bid (ITB) Title: Rainwear and Related Supplies

ITB Number: 1156-12-MYP

Revised Due Date: June 26, 2012 - 2:00 p.m.

Buyer: Michelle Poste, michelle.poste@kingcounty.gov, 206-263-9303

Alternate Buyer: ‘Paul Price, paul.price@kingcounty.gov, 206-263-9309

This addendum is issued to revise the original Invitation to Bid No. 1156-12-MYP:
1. The bid opening date has changed from June 21, 2012 to June 26, 2012.

2. Replace Sub-Section 6.7.C Schedule Three — Neese- Hi Visibility Yellow-Green Rainwear
with Sub-Section 6.7.C Schedule Three — Neese- Hi Visibility Yellow-Green Rainwear
(REVISED)

Upon request, this Invitation to Bid Addendum will be provided in alternative
formats such as Braille, large print, audiocassette or computer disk for individuals
with disabilities.



Department of Executive Services

I nVitation to B | d m Finance and Business Operations Division

Procurement and Contract Services Section

Addendum #1 KingCounty 206-263-9400 TTY Relay: 711

ADDENDUM DATE: JUNE 13, 2012

Invitation to Bid (ITB) Title: Rainwear and Related Supplies
ITB Number: 1156-12-MYP
Revised Due Date: June 26, 2012 - 2:00 p.m.

Buyer: Michelle Poste, michelle.poste@kingcounty.gov, 206-263-9303

Alternate Buyer: Paul Price, paul.price@kingcounty.gov, 206-263-9309

This addendum is issued to revise the original Invitation to Bid No. 11566-12-MYP:

r The bid opening date has changed from June 21, 2012 to June 26, 2012.

2. Replace Sub-Section 6.7.C Schedule Three — Neese- Hi Visibility Yellow-Green Rainwear
with Sub-Section 6.7.C Schedule Three — Neese- Hi Visibility Yellow-Green Rainwear
(REVISED)

Upon request, this Invitation to Bid Addendum will be provided in alternative
formats such as Braille, large print, audiocassette or computer disk for individuals
with disabilities.



Department of Executive Services

I nVitatlon to Bld m Finance and Business Operatlons Division

Procurement and Contract Services Section

Addendum #2 KingCounty 206-263-9400 TTY Relay: 711

ADDENDUM DATE: JUNE 20, 2012

Invitation to Bid (ITB) Title;: Rainwear and Related Supplies

ITB Number: 1156-12-MYP

Revised Due Date: July 10, 2012 - 2:00 p.m,

Buyer: Michelle Poste, michelle.poste@kingcounty.gov, 206-263-9303

Alternate Buyer: Paul Price, paul.price@kingcounty.gov, 206-263-9309

This addendum is issued to revise the original Invitation to Bid No. 1156-12-MYP:

1. The bid opening date has changed from June 26, 2012 to July 10, 2012.

Upon request, this Invitation to Bid Addendum will be provided in alternative
formats such as Braille, large print, audiocassette or computer disk for individuals
with disabilities.



Procurement and Contract Services Section

» . . Department of Executive Services
I nVltatl O n to B I d m Finance and Business Operations Division

Addendum #3 King County 206-263-9400 TTY Relay: 711

ADDENDUM DATE: JUNE 25, 2012

Invitation to Bid (ITB) Title: Rainwear and Related Supplies

ITB Number: 1156-12-MYP

Due Date: July 10, 2012 - 2:00 p.m.

Buyer: Michelle Poste, michelle.poste@kingcounty.gov, 206-263-9303

Alternate Buyer: Paul Price, paul.price@kingcounty.gov, 206-263-9309

This addendum is issued to revise the original Invitation to Bid No. 1156-12-MYP:

1. The bid opening shall remain the same.

2. Add the following to Section 5:
512 Requirements Specific to Schedule E — Carhartt Foul Weather Gear

A. Order/Invoicing Procedures

1.

Contractor shall participate in King County’s Uniform Voucher Program. Presently,
this program consists of a Personal Clothing Voucher form in lieu of cash. Additional
information regarding the Voucher program will be provided upon contract award.

For most King County employees, foul weather gear shall be purchased from
Contractor upon presentation of the appropriate Personal Clothing Voucher
authorization form, completed and containing the signature of an authorized King
County supervisor.

Employees not participating in voucher program, must provide two (2) forms of
identification to the Contractor, i.e., Washington State Drivers License and King
County Employee badge. Upon providing proper identification, Contractor shall
allow the employee to purchase Carhartt foul weather gear per the contract pricing.
If proper identification and King County badge cannot be provided, Contractor shall
not be obligated to honor contracted pricing.

Contractor shall invoice the County on a monthly basis. Invoices will identify
employee name, base location code (if applicable), style, total price of item chosen
and provide all such information as is requested on the voucher form.

Upon request, this Invitation to Bid Addendum will be provided in alternative
formats such as Braille, large print, audiocassette or computer disk for individuals
with disabilities.



3. Add the following to 6.7 Pricing:
E. Schedule 5- Carhartt Foul Weather Gear
The Contractor shall provide Carhartt foul weather gear meeting the following general standards:

1. Flame Resistant rated Carhartt Heavy Jackets; Light Jackets; Bib Overalls lined bib overalls unlined and
accessories. Rainwear must also be Flame Resistant rated. The Flame Resistant specifications referenced are
NFPA 70E; ASTMF 1506 and OSHA 29CFR-1910-269

2. Safety vests and rain jackets shall be ANSI/ISEA 107-2010 Class 3 Level 2.

3. Contractor shall apply a 2” wide reflective strip stitched to coat/vest mid-back length and bottom hem. On coat,
reflective strip shall be applied to cuff length also.

4. Contractor shall provide a variety of sizes for all items. (i.e., XS to 6XLT)

5. Carhartt jacket/vest colors: Black, Brown, Blue, or Green. No camouflage will be accepted.

6. All Jackets and vests shall be affixed with a King County Metro patch provided by the Contractor. The patch shall
be 2-1/2"W X 4°L, stitched on upper left side of jacket or vest. See Exhibit 1 for a sample illustration for
informational purposes only.

Disc.
%
Item Est. Annual from Extended
No. Usage Description MSLP | Discount Total
1 10,000.00 | Carhartt Foul Weather Gear % | $
3 As *1°2.350) |® 7502 -
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