Finance and Business Operations Division =~ SONTRACTOR;

» Procurement and Contracts Services Section LINCOLN TOWING CONTRACT
. Department of Executive Services ;gzgnggggg“: AVE N
RACT NO. R SION PAGE
. 3 Floor 206-296-76T6 Fax Fax: {206) 3637376
ngcounty 401 5 Avenus ’ TTY Relay: 771
SEATTLE, WA 98104 wwiw kingcounty.goy
i BILL TO: CREATION DATE BUYER
KC DES FBOD PCSS GOODS AND SERVICES KC DES FBOD ACCOUNTS PAYABLES 06-JUN-2012 PATRICIA REID
401 5TH AVE, CHNK-ES-0340 401 5TH AVE, CNEK-ES-0320
SEATTLE, WA 98104 SEATTLE, WA 98104 DATE OF REVISION | BUYER

DESCRIPTION

Contract Purchase Agreement

Furnish On-Call Towing Services as requested by
King County andfor Sound Transit personnel during
the period June 5, 2012 through June 4, 2017,

in accordance with ITB#1044-12, and the responding
bid from Lincoln Towlng, both Incorporated by
reference as if fully set forth herain.

Awarded Araas:
Area 1 Sole Provider

Area 2 Sole Provider
Area 3 Seondary

ndividual Standard Purchase orders
ith unique Purchase Order numbers

eferencing this contract purchase
greement wlll be [ssued by King
ounty to authorize the purchase

nd payment of goods and services.

All inveices must reference the Individual
Standard Purchase Order Number to aveid delay
in payments.

Estimated annual contract value $50,000.00.




k4
King County
Finance and
Business Operations Division
Procurement and Contract Services Section
Department of Executive Services

CNK-ES-0340
401 Fifth Avenue, 3™ floor
Seattle, WA 98104-1818

206-263-9400
206-296-7676 Fax
TTY Relay: 711

www. kingcounky,gov

© May 21. 2012

RE: King County ITB#1144-12-PLR On.C'all Towing Services

Thank you for submitting a proposal for the above referenced King County Invitation to Bid.
This is notice your firm has been selected as one of the apparent successful bidders by

area.

Area 1 North West King County
Lincoln Towing

.Area 2 North Central King County
Lincoln Towing

Area 3 North East King County
Skyway Towing and Recovery-
Lincoln Towing

Areé 4 South East Central King County
Fitz Towing
Skyway Towing and Recovery

.Area 5 South East King County
Fitz Towing
Pro-Tow

Area 8 South West King County
Fitz Towing
Pro-Tow

Area 7 Central King County
Skyway Towing and Recovery
Airport Towing

Area 8 Vashon Island

$1,100.25
$1,586.25

$1,336.05
$1,586.25

$821.00
$971.55

$797.00
$1,069.66

$797.00
$1,069.66

$971.55
$1,035.00

Primary
Secondary

~ Primary
Secondary

Primary
Secondary

Primary
Secondary

Primary
Secondary



Airport Towing - $1,915.00 (includes ferry fees)
This selection and final award is conditioned upon your compliance with applicable State
and County laws, the terms and conditions specified in the ITB document, and your
response.

Again, thank you for your participation in this solicitation.

Sincerely,

Patty Reid, CPPB

King County Procurement and Contract Services
206-263-9304 phone

206-296-7676 fax



1044-12-PLR Towing Services

"|Fitz Towing

2416 E. Street NE

Lincoln Twn Entrlse
12220 Aurora Ave N.

Pro-Tow
23933 SE 264th St

Skywy owin Rcoery
2960 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA

Airport Towing 817
SW 149th St Burien,

Auburn, WA 93002 Seattle, WA 98133 - Maple Valley, WA 98038 98057 WA
AREA ONE
Northwest - King County
item Dascription Est. UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
No. Gty
1 {Service Call 1 | Per Bervice Call (Flal Rate |[NO BID $ 69.00 |[NO BID 3 175.00 {NO BID
Only)
2 |Flat Bed Tow Call 1 | Per Tow (Flat Rate Only) 5 121.00 3 225.00
2a |Light Tow gross weight rating of not 1 | (Flat Rate QOnly) Per Tow $ 101.00 $ 200.00
rmore than 10,000 pounds
2b |Medium Tow gross weight rating of 1 | (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow $ 246.76 3 250.00
more than 10,000 pounds but not
more than 26,000
2c |Heavy Tow gross weight rating of 1 | {Flat Rate Cnly) Per Tow $ 334.25 $ 350.00
more than 26,000 -
3 |Stand-by Time 1|8 Per % 27.50 k] 40.00
fifteen minute intervals
4 [Winching w/ Light Truck 1 18 Per $ 27.50 $ 40.00
fifteen minute intervals
4a |Winching w/ Medium Truck 1 1% Per , 3 49.50 $ 45.00
fifteen minute intervals
4b |Winching w/ Heavy Class C Truck 1 |8 Per $ . 49.50 3 50.00
fitteen minute intervals .
5 |Drive Line Removal 1 fPer vehicle $ 49,50 $ 40.00
6 {Dolly Rental 1 | Per Tow Job $ 29.00 $ 40.00
7 |Mileage Fee 1 | Per Mile $ 4,75 $ 4.50
8 (Bidders state the number of licensed No. of Trucks: No. of Trucks: 40 No. of Trucks: 10 No, of Trucks: 10 No. of Trucks:
Towing Truck available to perfform 15 12
services in Area One
9 |Bidders shall list their firms Slreet Fitz Towing Lincoln Towing Enterprise Pro-Tow Skyway Towing & Recovery Airport Towing 817

Address and/or equipment stations for 2416 E. Street NE 12220 Aurora Ave N. 23933 SE 264th St 2960 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA SW 149th St Burien,
Area One Auburn, WA 98002 Seattle, WA 98133 Maple Valley, WA 98038 98057 WA
Area 1 totals NO BID § 1,109.25 NO BID $ 1,459.50 NO BID
AWARD Non-responsive - cannot respond

within 30 minutes




Fitz Towing
2416 E, Street NE
Auburn, WA 98002

Lincoln Towing Enterprise
12220 Aurora Ave N.
Seattle, WA 98133

Pro-Tow
123933 SE 264th St
Maple Valley, WA 98038

Skyway Towing & Recovery
2960 E. Valley Rd. Ronton, WA
98057

Airport Towing 817
SW 145th 5t Burien,
WA

AREA TWO
North Central - King County
Item Description Est. Uuom Unrit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
No. Gty
1 [Service Call 1 | Per Service Call (Flat Rale (NO BID $ 101.00 (NO BID $ 175.00 [NO BID
Only)
2 [Flat Bed Tow Call 1 | Per Tow (Flat Rate Only) $ 121.00 3 200.00
2a |Light Tow gross weight rating of not 1 | {(Flat Rate Only) Per Tow $ 101.00 3 175.00
more than 10,000 pounds
2b |Medium Tow gross weight rating of 1 1 (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow $ 423.00 5 225.00
more than 10,000 pounds but not
more than 26,000
2c |Heavy Tow gross weight rating of 1 | (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow 3 573.00 $ 325.00
moare than 26,000
3 [Stand-by Time 1 1% Per $ 57.50 H 40.00
fifteen minute intervals
4 [Winching wiLight Truck 1|8 Per $ 27.50 5 40.00
fifteen minute intervals
4a |Winching w/ Medium Truck 118 Per fifteen $ 49.50 $ 45.00
minute intervals
4b |Winching w/ Heavy Class C Truck 1 1% Per fiftaen $ 49.50 3 50.00
minute intervals .
5 |Drive Line Removal 1 [Per vehicle 1 49,50 % 40.00
6 [Dolly Rental 1 | Per Tow Job $ 25.00 8 40.00
7 |Mileage Fee 1 | Per Mile $ . 475 $ 4,50
B |Bidders state the number of licensed No, of Trucks: No. of Trucks; 40 No. of Trucks: No. of Trucks:_ 10 No. of Trueks:
Towing Truck available to perform 15 10 12
services in Area Two
9 |Bidders shall list their firms Street Fitz Towing Lincoin TowIng Enterprise Pro-Tow Skyway Towing & Recovery Airport Towing 817
Address and/or equipment stalions for 2416 E. Street NE 12220 Aurora Ave N. 23933 SE 264th St 2960 E. Valley Rd.  Renton, WA |SW 149th St Burien,
Area Two - Auburn, WA 98002 Seattle, WA 98133 Maple Valley, WA 98038 98057 WA
Area 2 totals NO BID $ 1,586.25 NO BID $ 1,359.50 NO BID
- AWARD Non-responsive - cannot respond

within 30 minutes




Fitz Towfng Pro-Tow Skywag; 'To;vmg & Recovary- Hrpod Towing 817
2416 E. Street NE 12220 Aurora Ave N. 23933 SE 264th 5t 2360 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA S5W 149th S5t Burien,
Aubum, WA 93002 Seatile, WA 98133 Maple Valley, WA 93038 98057 WA
AREA THREE
North East - King County
ltem Description Est. Uom Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
No. Oty
1 |Service Call 1 | Per Service Call (Flat Rate [NO BID $ 101.00 | $ 279.95 | § 200.00 [NO BID
Only)
2 |Fiat Bed Tow Call 1 | Per Tow {Ffat Rate Only} H 121.00 | § 299851 % 225.00
2a |Light Tow gross weight rating of not 1 | {(Flat Rate Only} Per Tow $ 101.00 | & 29995 | § 200.00
more than 10,000 pounds
2b |Medium Tow gross weight rating of 1 | (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow % 42300 | % 329951 % 250.00
more than 10,000 pounds but not
mere than 26,000
2¢ [Heavy Tow gross weight rating of 1 | (Flat Rate Only} Per Tow $ 573.00 | % 399985 $ 350.00
rmore than 26,000
3 |Stand-by Time 108 Per % 5750 % 35.00| % 40,00
fifteen minute intervals
4 {Wwinching wilight Truck 1 (% Per $ 2750 | 3 3500 % 40.00
fifteen minule intervals
4a |Winching w/ Medium Truck 1 (8 Per 3 4950 | 8 40.00 | § 45.00
fifteen minute intervals
4b  [Winching w/ Heavy Class C Truck 1 (3 Per 5 49.50 | § 50.00 | & 50.00
[fleen minute intervals
5 |Drive Line Removal 1 |Per vehicle 3 4950 1 $ 3495 | % 40.00
6 |Dolly Rental 1 | Per Tow Job $ 29.00 | N/IC 3 40.00
7 |Mileage Fee 1 | Per Mile E 475 | % 495§ 4.50
8 |Bidders state the number of licensed No. of Trucks: No. of Trucks; 40 No. of Trucks: Mo, of Trucks: 10 No. of Trucks:
Towing Truck available to perform 15 10 12
services in Area Three
9 |Bidders shall list their firms Street Fitz Towing Lincaln Towing Enterprise Pro-Tow Skyway Towing & Recovery Airport Towing 817
Address and/or equipment stations for 2416 E. Street NE 12220 Aurora Ave N. 23933 SE 2G4th S5t 2960 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA SW 149th St Burien,
Area Three Auburn, WA 98002 Seattle, WA 98133 Maple Valley, WA 98038 98057 WA '
Area 3 totals NO BID $ 1,586.25 | § 1,814.60 | § 1,484.50 NO BID
Prompt payment terms
prompt payment discount [J
GRAND TOTAL
AWARD #2 AWARD #1




Fitz Towing Lincoln Towing Enterprise Pro-Tow Skyway Towing & Recovery Airport Towing 817
2416 E. Strest NE 12220 Aurora Ave N, 23933 SE 264th St 2950 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA SW 149th St Burien,
Aubumn, WA 98002 Seattle, WA 98133 Maple Valley, WA 98038  [98057 WA
AREA FOUR
South East Central - King County
Itern Description Est uom Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
No. Gty
1 |Service Call 1 Per Service Call (Flat Rate $ 5000 | 101.00 | $ 12495 | $ 125.00 |NO BID
Only)

2 |Flat Bed Tow Call 1 | Per Tow (Flat Rate Only) $ 85.00 | 5 12100 | $ 184.95 | § 150.06

2a |Light Tow gross weight rating of not 1 | (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow $ 80.00 | $ 10100 | 8 184.895 | $ 135.00
more than 10,000 pounds

2b |Medium Tow gross weight rating of 1 { (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow 5 17250 | $ 423.00 | § 20995 | § 160.00
muore than 10,000 pounds but not
mere than 26,000

2c |Heavy Tow gross weight rating of 1 [ (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow $ 245.00 | § 573.00 | $ 27995 | $ 250,00
more than 26,000

3 |Stand-by Time 118 Per 3 45.00 | § 27.50 | $ 35.00| % 40.00

P ——— =t

4 \Winching wiLight Truck 1|8 Per $ 25.00 | § 27501(% 35.00 | $ 40.00

fifteen minute intervals
4a {Winching w/ Medium Truck 1 |8 Per $ 35001 % 4950 | § 4000 | § 45.00
fifteen minute intervals

4b |Winching w/ Heavy Class C Truck 1 |s Per |§ 40.00 | 5 4350 | § 50.00 | & 50.00

fifteen minule intervals

5 |Drive Line Removal 1 |Per vehicle $ 15.00 | $ 49.50 | $ 3495 | $ 40.00

6 [Dolly Rental 1 | Per Tow Job NiC | % 29.00 NiC | % 40.00

7 |Mileage Fee 1 |Per Mile $ 450 ( § 475 (% 495 |% 4.50

8 |Bidders state the number of icensed No. of Trucks: No. of Trucks: No. of Trucks: No. of Trucks: 10 No. of Trucks:

Towing Tneck available o perform 15 40 10 _ 42
services in Area Four -

9 |Bidders shall list their firms Street Fitz Towing Lincoln Towing Enterprise Pro-Tow 420|Skyway Towing & Recovery Airport Towing 817
Address andfor equipment stations for 2416 E, Street NE 12220 Aurora Ave N. H Street NW Auburn, WA [2960 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA SW149th St Burien,
Area Four Auburn, WA 98002 Seattle, WA 98133 98001 98057 WA

, Area 4 totals $ 821.00 ($ 1,666.25 | § 1,184.65 | $ 1,079.50 NO BID
AWARD #1 Prompt payment terms
prompt payment discount
GRAND TOTAL




Fitz Towing

Lincln Towing Enterprise

Pro-Tow

Skyway Towing & Recovery

Airport Towing * 817|

Area Five

Auburn, WA 98002

Seattle, WA 98133

Maple Valley, WA 58038

98057

2416 E, Street NE 42220 Aurora Ave N, 23933 SE 264th St 2960 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA SW 149th St Burien,
Auburn, WA 98002 Seattle, WA 98133 Maple Valley, WA 858038  |98057 WA .
AREA FIVE . S
South East - King County Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price -Unit Price .
Item Description Est. uom
No. Qty T
1 |[Service Call 1 | Per Service Call (Flat Rate { § 50.00 | & 101.00 | $ . 99.95 | § 150.00 |NO BID
Only)
2 |{Flat Bed Tow Call 1 | Per Tow (Flat Rate Only) $ 85.00 | § 121.00 | $ 159.95 | § 200.00
2a |Light Tow gross weight rating of not 1 { (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow $ 8000 | S 101.00 | $ 159.95 [ § 175.00
more than 10,000 pounds )
2b |Medium Tow gross weight rating of 1 | (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow $ . 17260 | $ 42300 | 3 19995 [ § 200,00 |
mare than 10,000 pounds but not ’ }
more than 26,000 - R
2¢ [Heavy Tow gross weight rating of 1 | (Fiat Rate Only} Per Tow $ 24500 | $ 523.00 | & 24295 | % 300,00
more than 26,000 S
.3 |Stand-by Time 1 0% Per $ 45.00 ( $ 27.50 | $ 35.00 | § 40.00
fifteen minute intervals
4 |Winching wiLight Truck 108 Per $ 2500 | 3 27.50 | 3 3500 (% 40.00
fifteen minute intervals
4a |Winching wf Medium Truck 1 % Per $ 35.00 | & 48.50 | $ 40,00 ( § 45,00
) fifteen minute intervals
4b |Winching w/ Heavy Class C Truck 1 (% Per $ 40.00 | § 4950 | % 50.00 | $ 50.00
fifteen minute intervals
% |Drive Line Removal 1 |Per vehicle $ 15001 % 49.50 | $ 3495 % 40.00
6 |Doally Rental 1 | Per Tow Job $ - $ 29.00 | $ - 5 40.00 -
7 [Mileage Fee ) 1 | Per Mile $ 480 |$ 475 | % 495 % 450 s
- 8 |Bidders state the number of licensed MNo. of Trucks: No. of Trucks; 40 No. of Trucks: Ne. of Trucks: 10 No. of Trucks:
Towing Truck available to perform 156 10 12 -
services in Area Five - -
9 (Bidders shall list their firms Street Fitz Towing Lincoln Towing Enterprise Pro-Tow Skyway Towing & Recovery Airport Towing = 817
Address and/or equipment stalions for, 2416 E. Street NE 12220 Aurora Ave N. 23933 SE 284th St 2960 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA

SW 149th 5t Burien,

Area 5 totals

$

797.00

$

1,608.25

$

1,069.66

AWARD #1

AWARD #

2

$

1,284.50

NO BID




Fitz Towing Lincoln Towing Enterprise Pro-Tow Skyway Towing & Recovery Airport Towing 817
2416 E. Street NE 12220 Aurora Ave N, 23933 SE 264th St 2960 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA SW 149th St Burien,
Aubumn, WA 98002 Seattle, WA 98133 Maple Valley, WA 98038  [98057 WA
AREA SIX
Southwest - King County Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
ltemn Description Est. Uom
No. Oty .
1 |Senvice Call 1 [ Per Service Call (FlatRate | $ 5000 | $ 101.00 | $ 99.95 | 150,00 | $ 125.00
Cnly)
2 {[Flat Bed. Tow Call 1 | Per Tow {Flat Rate Only) $ 8E.00 | § 121.00 | § 159.95 | $ 200,00 | & 150.00
2a |Light Tow gross weight rating of not 1 | (Fial Rate Only} Per Tow $ 80.00 | 8 101.00 | § 159.95 [ $ 175.00 | $ 150.00
more than 10,000 pounds
2b |Medium Tow gross weight rating of 1 { (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow $ 17250 | $ 42300 % 19995 | & 200,00 | & 250,00
more than 10,000 pounds but not
more than 26,000
2¢ |Heavy Tow gross weighl rating of 1 | (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow $ ' 24500 | & 523.00 | § 24995 | % 300.00 | 8 300.00
more than 26,000
3 |Stand-by Time 1 1% Per $ 45.00 | § 2750 | $ 3500 | $ 40.00 | $ 30.00
fifleen minute intervals
4 |Winching wiLight Truck 18 Per $ 2500 | 5 27.50| % 3500 | & 40,00 | 3 40.00
fifteen minute intervals
4a |Winching w/ Medium Truck 1 18 Per s 35.00 | $ 4950 | § 40,00 | 3 4500 | 8 50.00
fifeen minute intervals
4b |Winching w/ Heavy Class C Truck 1|8 Per |$% 4000 | % 49.50 | § 50.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 60.00
fifteen minule intervals
5 |Drive Line Removal 1 |Per vehicle $ 1500 | $ 4950 | & 3495 | % 40.00 | 8 405.00
6 |Dolly Rental i Per Tow Job $ - $ 2500 ( $ - b 4000 | & 40.00
7 |Miteage Fee 1 | Per Mile $ 450 | $ 4751 % 495 |§ 4501 % 5.00
8 |Bidders state the number of licensed MNo. of Trucks: No. of Trucks: 40 No. of Trucks: No. of Trucks: 10 No. of Trucks:
Towing Truck available to perform 15 10 12
services in Area Six
9 |Bidders shal list their firms Street Fitz Towing Lincoln Towing Enterprise  [Pro-Tow Skyway Towing & Recovery Alrport Towing 817
Address and/or equipment stations for 2416 E. Stroet NE 12220 Aurora Ave N, 23933 SE 264th St 2960 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA SW 149th St Burien,
Area Six Auburn, WA 98002 Seattle, WA 98133 Maple Valley, WA 98038 98057 WA
Area Six Totals H 797.00 | $ 1,683.75 | § 1,069.65 | $ 1,284.50 | % 1,240.00
AWARD #1 AWARD #2




) if.z wing

Lincoln oing Ente

Pro-o

" 420

Skyway Tong Rovery .

' Alrport Towing 817

Prompt payment terms

prompt payment discount [§

GRAND TOTAL

 AWARD #1

rprie
2416 E. Street NE 12220 Aurora Ave N. H Street NW Auhuen, WA (2960 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA S5W 149th 5t Burien,
Auburn, WA 958002 Seattle, WA 98133 98001 98057 WA
Est. ugm
Qty
DESCRIPTION Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Area Seven
Gentral - King County
ltem Description Est UOM NO BID
No. ity
1 |Service Call 1 | Per Service Call (Flat Rate $101.00 124.95 125.00 80.00
Qnly)
2 _|Flat Bed Tow Call 1 Per Tow (Flat Rate Only} $121.00 184.95 150.00 120.00
2a |Light Tow gross weight rating of not 1 | (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow $101,00 184.95 135.00 120.00
more than 10,000 pounds
2b |Medium Tow gross weight rating of 1 | (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow $423.00 209.95 160.00 200.00
more than 10,000 pounds but not
more than 26,000
26 |Heavy Tow gross weight raling of 1 | (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow $523.00 279.95 250,00 250.00
more than 26,000
3 |Stand-by Time 1 [$ Per $27.50 35.00 40.00 30.00
fifteen minute intervals
4a {Winching w/Light Truck 1 |$ Per $27.50| . 35.00 40.00 40.00
fifteen minute intervals
4b  |Winching w/Medium Truck 3 Per $49.50 40.00 45.00 50.00
fifteen minute intervats
4c |Winching w/Heavy Class C Truck s Per $49.50 50.00 50.00 60.00
fifteen minute intervals
5 |Drive Ling Removal 1 [Per vehicle $49.50 34.95 4000 40.60
6 |Dolly Rental 1 | Per Tow Job $29.00|N/IC 40.00 40.00
7 |Mieage Fee 1 | Per Mite $4.75 495 4.50| 5.00
& |Bidders state the number of licensed No, of Trucks: No. of Trucks; 40 No. of Trucks: No. of Trucks: 10 Mo of Trucks:
Towing Truck available to perform 15 10 12
services in Area Seven
9 [Bidders shall list their firms Street Fitz Towing Lincoln Towing Enterprise Pro-Tow 420|Skyway Towing & Recovery Airport Towing 817
Address andfor equipment stations for 2416 E. Street NE |12220 Aurora Ave N. H Street NW Auburn, WA |2960 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA S5W 149th St Burien,
Area Seven Auburn, WA 98002 Seattle, WA 98133 98001 98057 WA
Area Seven NO BID §1,506.25 $1,184.65 $1,079.50 $1,035.00

AWARD #2




" |Fitz Towing

) Inco Towin Enerlse

Pro-Tow 420

kyway Towi Recry

Qty 2416 E. Street NE 12220 Aurora Ave N. H Street NW Auburn, WA (2960 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA
Aubeum, WA 98002 Seattle, WA 93133 98001 98057
Itom DESCRIPTION Unit Prige Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Area Eight
VASHON ISLAND Each NO BID
Description Est. uom
Oty
1 |Service Call 1 | Per Service Call (Flat Rate $ 461.00 | & 27995 | % 250.00
Only)
2 |Flat Bed Tow Call 1 | Per Tow (Flat Rate Only) $ 461.00 | $ 29995 | $ 400.00
2a |Light Tow gross weight rating of not 1 | (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow 5 461.00 | § 20995 | & 400.00
more than 10,000 pounds
2b [Medium Tow gross weight raling of 1 | (Flat Rate Only) Per Tow 3 56400 | & 32095, % : 450.00
more than 10,000 pounds but not
more than 26,000
2¢ |Heavy Tow gross weight rating of 1 | (Flat Rate Only} Per Tow $ 764.00 | $ 39995 | % 600.00
more than 26,000
3 |Stand-by Time i |8 Per s 97.00 | & 35001} % 40.00
4a |Winching wilight Truck 1|8 Per $ 97.00 | § 3500 (§ 40.00
fifleen minute intervals
4b |Winching wiMedium Truck § Per $ 121.00 | & 4000 | $ 45.00
fifteen minute intervals
4¢c  |Winching wiHeavy Class G Truck $ Per $ 12100 | & 50.00 | & 50.00
. fifteen minute intervals
& |Drive Line Removal 1 |Per vehicle 3 12100 | § 34951 % 40.00
6 {Dolly Rental 1 | Per Tow Job $ 29.00 | N/C $ 40.00
© 7 |Mileage Fee 1 | Per Mile 3 475| % 4951 % 4.50 .
8 [Bidders state the number of licensed No. of Trucks: No. of Trucks; 40 No. of Trucks: No. of Trucks: 15
Towing Truck available (o perform 15 19
servites in Area Eight
9 |Bidders shall list their firns Sireat Fitz Towing Lincoln Towing Enterprise Pro-Tow 420|Skyway Towing & Recovery
Address and/or equipment staticns for, 2416 E. Street NE 12220 Aurora Ave N. H Street NW Auburn, WA |2960 E. Valley Rd. Renton, WA
Area Eight Aubum, WA 98002 Seattle, WA 98133 9800 98057
Area Eight Totals NO BID $3,301.75 $1,809.65 $2,359.50
DOES NOT INCLUDE DOES NOT INCLUDE DOES NOT INCLUDE FERRY  [IN
FERRY FEES FERRY FEES FEES




